
• Variables were selected by finding survey questions that 
corresponded with the symptoms outlined in the Diagnostic and 
Statistical Manual of Disorders (DSM) for Major Depressive 
Disorder and Generalized Anxiety Disorder.

• There were a total of six anxiety variables. Included were 
restlessness, fatigue, difficulty concentrating, irritability, muscle 
tension, and sleep disturbance.

• There were originally a total of ten symptom variables for 
depression. Included were depressed mood, loss of interest, weight 
loss, weight gain, sleep disturbance, psychomotor 
agitation/retardation, fatigue, worthlessness/guilt, difficulty 
concentrating, and thoughts of death/suicidal ideation. Of the 
depression variables, depressed mood, loss of interest, and weight 
gain were not unable.

• In GAD and MDD, four symptoms overlap: sleep disturbance, 
psychomotor agitation/retardation, fatigue, and loss of concentration. 
Given the high comorbidity rates between anxiety and depression, 
these four variables were of key interest in whether they showed any 
relation.

Table 1. Results of exploratory factor analysis with a three-factor 
solution

• Exploratory factor analysis was conducted to evaluate the model fit. 
A 3-factor model demonstrated a superior fit over a 1- or 2-factor 
model.

• The variables identified as significant reflect the basic mechanisms 
that have been shown to be related to both anxiety and depression.

• The first factor is the motivation system with fatigue as a central 
feature.

• The second factor is the arousal and regulation system with sleep 
disturbance and restlessness as central features.

• The third factor is the cognition system with difficulty concentrating 
as a central feature.

• These three systems are transdiagnostic and present across anxiety 
and depression

• A polychoric correlation between a composite score of depression 
and anxiety symptoms was conducted which gave an output of 0.432 
indicating a moderate relationship.

• Many mental disorders are often conceptualized as discrete 
conditions with distinct patterns of behavior and distress (Krueger, 
1999).

• However, comorbidity, the co-occurrence of more than one disorder 
in the same individual, creates a dilemma in developing 
distinguishable diagnostic criteria. Pure cases of a mental disorder 
are atypical and are not representative of the larger population.

• The “P” factor, or the general factor of psychopathology, implies 
that there are shared psychopathological mechanisms that function 
across multiple mental disorders (Caspi et al. 2014).

• Anxiety and depression are both internalizing disorders found to be 
highly comorbid with each other. Sleep disturbance, psychomotor 
agitation/retardation, fatigue, and loss of concentration are 
symptoms shared by both Generalized Anxiety Disorder (GAD) and 
Major Depressive Disorder (MDD) (Zbozinek et al., 2013). 

• The Tripartite Model of Anxiety and Depression, proposed by Lee 
Anna Clark and David Watson, attempts to explain the overlap 
between symptoms of anxiety and depression. 

• This model divides anxiety and depression symptoms into three 
distinct categories – general distress, physiological hyperarousal 
(specific anxiety), and anhedonia (specific depression) (Clark & 
Watson, 1991). 

• What is the interaction between Generalized Anxiety Disorder 
(GAD) and Major Depressive Disorder (MDD) symptoms?

• Why are GAD and MDD commonly found to co-occur in 
individuals?

• Should clinical disorders continue to be conceptualized as discrete 
conditions and should treatment be approached as such?

• H1: Comorbidity is due to criterion overlap (eg. similar criteria) 
between GAD and MDD

• H2: Comorbidity is due to shared psychological and biological 
mechanisms 

This study examined the relation between GAD and MDD symptoms 
using exploratory factor analysis.

• Given the three categories of the Tripartite model, it was predicted 
that symptoms would be split into three factors. The three factors 
would contain symptoms that fell under general distress, 
physiological hyperarousal, and anhedonia.

• Data used in this study is from the National Comorbidity Survey 
Replication (NCS-R) Survey, which contains data from a national 
sample of 10,000 respondents. The National Comorbidity Survey 
(NCS) Series was designed to examine the prevalence, risk factors, 
and consequences of psychiatric morbidity and comorbidity in the 
United States (ICPSR, 2022).

• The 3-factor model indicates that the symptoms of anxiety and 
depression can be split into the three core systems recognized in 
GAD and MDD.

• Further model testing and theorizing should be conducted in the 
future to better understand why these models overlap.

• Further model testing and theorizing should be conducted in the 
future to better understand how the other symptoms of GAD and 
MDD might play a different role than those shown to be significant.

• The findings of this study suggest that the complex relationship of 
the overlap between GAD and MDD can be linked to the similarities 
in their symptoms, but also their similarities in their mechanisms.

• Following a framework such as the National Institute of Mental 
Health’s Research Domain Criteria (RDoC), which focuses on 
disruptions in normal functions by instead utilizing observable 
behavior and neurobiological measures, could be beneficial and 
examining the neurobehavioral fields relevant to mental disorders 
(Morris et al. 2022).

• In addition to the overlap in criterion, the findings suggest that there 
is another component that is crossing through GAD and MDD that 
relates to psychological and biological mechanisms.

• The mechanisms that have been shown to be related to both anxiety 
and depression suggest a better place to focus future efforts and 
research.

• Further research should be conducted to gain a better understanding 
of these mechanisms so as to aid in the development of treatment 
and diagnosis.
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